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As I write this article on October 23 for the October 30 edition of the Beacon, by the time you 
read this we will thankfully be only a few days away from the election.  All of the presidential 
election campaigns in recent memory have been unpleasant and tiresome, but this one is much, 
much different than the others.  

There is so much at stake in this election. This one has the potential for completely changing our 
way of life in this country.  Senator Obama is a socialist, a Marxist, and has made it no secret 
that he will make big changes to reflect his views.   

He has stated that his first act would be to sign the Freedom of Choice Act, wiping out decades 
of hard work by people who have been trying to stop the holocaust of abortion in this country.  
He is in favor of any type of abortion.  All abortion is heinous, but he even favors the most 
heinous of all, partial birth abortion, which is just a euphemism for infanticide. 

He is against our constitutional right to bear arms, and our right to defend ourselves, our families 
and our property. 

He wants to transfer wealth from not just the wealthy, but from average citizens, giving it to 
those who won’t work, those who are corrupt, and people who aren’t citizens of the United 
States. 

He wants to take the United States into a new world order, so that we all can become global 
citizens, bending to the will of the United Nations. 

He has ties to voter fraud and a shady real estate deal, and favors homosexual rights. 

So far, I could have been describing Bill Clinton.  We all had those same fears about him in the 
1992 and 1996 elections.  When Lyndon Johnson ran for president in 1964, many believed he 
was a communist. 

Richard Nixon disgraced us with his cover-up and Jimmy Carter was an incompetent failure.  

So if we survived all of those, why wouldn’t we survive an Obama Presidency? 

We survived Bill Clinton because we had a Republican Congress to counteract his attempts to 
socialize medicine and other liberal policies that he wanted to implement. 

We survived Lyndon Johnson because he really wasn’t a communist and most people in those 
days were conservative, even Democrats. 

We survived Richard Nixon because we had a good man to take his place, and all other things 
considered, Nixon was not a terrible president. 



We survived Jimmy Carter because the American people had the good sense to elect Ronald 
Reagan not once, but twice, to fix his foul-ups. 

And while all of the presidents have made mistakes, so far America has survived them all. 

But this election is different.  Obama is like no other man who has ever run for president.  This 
man has an agenda to radically change this country in a way that will destroy many of our 
freedoms.  And above all, this man is evil, and what is really frightening about that is that so 
many good people believe that he is good, and there may be no Republican majority to 
counteract his actions.  In fact, we may have a Congress and Senate that will rubber-stamp 
whatever he wants. 

So, what will this nation be like if Obama does get elected? 

The Fairness Doctrine will become law and conservative talk radio will disappear.   

Millions of children who might have survived will die when he enacts the Freedom of Choice 
Act. 

He will demand confiscation of guns.  It’s already happened in Great Britain and Australia.  
Obama wants to do the same. 

Free speech against homosexuality in churches and elsewhere will come under attack as “hate” 
speech.  That has already happened in Canada. 

He will socialize medicine, making it difficult for us to get adequate health care when we need it. 

Many people have already lost their jobs, as companies begin to scale back and brace themselves 
for what they know will be hard economic times under an Obama administration.  Many more 
will lose their jobs as he forces this country into a socialist model. 

I believe the Church will suffer greatly under an Obama Administration.  Though I have never 
heard him speak about New Urbanism, it fits the United Nations model, and so it will be 
promoted more than ever, creating an environment that will gradually erode churches away from 
public view.   

Small towns will suffer, too, as New Urbanist policies will favor the migration of our rural 
populations to cities. 

This presidential campaign should be a wakeup call to all conservatives that we have to fight to 
preserve our Constitutional rights more than ever.  I just hope and pray that on November 5th I 
wake up to find that the American people have made a wise choice and rejected Barack Obama. 
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